© 00 N o o -~ w N P

e T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S e
0o N o o M WwWODNBP O O 0o N o o8 dD WwWDN -, O

ORDINANCE 457.90

AN ORDINANCE OF THECOUNTY OFRIVERSIDEAMENDING ORDINANCENO. 457 RELATING
TO THE BUILDING REQUIREMENTS AND ADOPTING THE 1994 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM
ADMINISTRATIVECODE; THE1994EDITION OF THE UNIFORM BUILDING CODE, INCLUDING
THE APPENDIX AND STANDARDS; THE 1994 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM HOUSING CODE;
THE 1994 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM CODE FOR THE ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS
BUILDINGS; THE 1994 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM MECHANICAL CODE, INCLUDING THE
APPENDIX AND STANDARDS; THE 1994 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE,
INCLUDING THE APPENDIX AND STANDARDS; THE 1994 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM
SWIMMING POOL, SPA AND HOT TUB CODE; THE 1993 EDITION OF THE NATIONAL
ELECTRICAL CODE; THE 1994 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM SIGN CODE; AND THE 1994
EDITION OF THE UNIFORM CODE FOR BUILDING CONSERVATION, ASTHE STANDARDS OF
SAID ORDINANCE. *

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Riverside Ordains As Follows.
Section 1. Ordinance No. 457 is amended to read as follows:

SECTION 1
APPLICATION
SECTION 1.

A. This Ordinance shall apply to al grading, buildings and structures, or parts thereof in the
unincorporated areas of the County of Riverside, unless hereafter specifically exempted.

B. The finished floor elevation of al residential structures used for human occupancy shall meet the
following criteria

1. If specific floor elevations, recommended by the Riverside County Flood Control and Water
Conservation District or Coachella Valley Water District in connection with granting of any
permit or approval have been fixed, those elevations shall be used.

2. If no elevations have been fixed in connection with an approved grading plan, the finished floor
shall be located at the highest elevation required by the following criteria:

a. Level lots shall have the finished floor elevated a minimum of one foot above the adjacent
ground.

b. Sloping lots shal have the finished floor elevated a minimum of one foot above the finished
pad elevation measured at the upstream edge of the structure.

c. Where the lot drains toward the adjacent road or is subject to water impounded behind an
adjacent road, thefinished floor shall be elevated aminimum of one (1) foot above the center
line of that adjacent road.

3. Thereguirements of this section may be waived or modified by the building official if aproposed
method of construction, prepared by a registered civil engineer, provides equivalent flood
protection or if the unique characteristics of a building site make the requirements unnecessary.

*  NOTE: RIVERSIDECOUNTY BUILDING & SAFETY ISCURRENTLY ENFORCING THE 1997
UNIFORM CODES, EFFECTIVE JULY 14, 1999, BY STATE MANDATE, PER CALIFORNIA
HEALTH AND SAFETY CODE, SECTION 18938.




© 00 N o o -~ w N P

e T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S e
0o N o o M WwWODNBP O O 0o N o o8 dD WwWDN -, O

2

C. No building permit shall be issue by the building official for any structure if the construction thereof

will violate the provisions of any State law or County Ordinance, including Land Use Ordinance No.
348, the Flood Management Ordinance No. 458, the Land Division Ordinance No. 460, the Surface
Mining Ordinance No. 555, the Alquist-Priolo Special Studies Zoning Ordinance No. 547 or the
County Fire Ordinance No. 546.

Coachella Valley Fringe-toed Lizard Fee Assessment Area. In addition to the requirements of this
Ordinance, al applicants for abuilding permit, grading permit, mobile home site preparation permit,
or amobile home installation permit for land situated in the CoachellaValley Fringe-toed Lizard Fee
Assessment Area, as that area is defined in the Coachella Valley Fringe-toed Lizard Habitat
Conservation Plan and the Section 10(b) Permit and the Habitat Conservation Plan issued by the
United Statesof Americato the County of Riverside pursuant to the Endangered SpeciesAct of 1973
(16 U.S.C. Section 1531 et seq.), shall comply with all of the provisions of the Section 10(a) Permit
and the Habitat Conservation Plan, and no building or grading permit withinthe Fee Assessment Area
shall be issued until the applicant provides the building official with satisfactory evidence that all
mitigation required by the Section 10(a) Permit and Habitat Conservation Plan, including the payment
of fees, has been provided.

Earthquake Fault Zones. In addition to the requirements of this Ordinance, all applicants for a
building permit for a structure used for human occupancy that lies within an earthquake fault zone
delineated by the State Geologist pursuant to Section 2621 et seq. of the Public Resources Code, and
whichissubject to Riverside County Ordinance No. 547, shall comply with al the provisionsthereof,
and no building permit subject thereto shall be granted except in accordance with the provisions of
said Ordinance, unlessthe project has already been approved pursuant to the provisions of Ordinance
No. 547.

F. Rubbish and Debris.

1. Collections and Disposal. During the process of constructing a building or structure, the
construction siteand the general areaaround the site shall be kept clear of rubbish and debristhat
results from the construction activities. Rubbish and debris shall not be alowed to accumulate
on, or be blown from, the site and shall be placed in appropriate containers or removed fromthe
construction site to an authorized disposal area. All containers shall be emptied periodically
at an authorized disposal area so they will remain usable for the collection of rubbish and debris.
When the building or structure is completed, afinal clean-up of the site shall be conducted by
the permittee.

2. Inspections. A permit holder shall not be entitled to, and no inspector shall make an inspection
of any phase of completed construction work, including the final inspection, if the construction
Site or general area thereof contains an accumulation of rubbish and debris. If an inspector is
unable to conduct a requested inspection because of an accumulation of rubbish and debris, a
reinspection fee in accordance with the provisions of Section 305.7 and 305.8 of the Uniform
Administrative Code shall be paid at the time of the request for reinspection.

3. Rubbish and debrisfor the purpose of this section, includes but isnot limited to, stub ends of cut
lumber, broken lumber and other scrap wood, scrap cement and plaster, scrap metal, paper
cartons, wrappings, and similar materials that result from the process of constructing a building
or structure.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

G. Construction Noise.

1. Whenever aconstruction site is within one-quarter (1/4) of amile of an occupied residence or
residences, no construction activities shall be undertaken between the hours of 6:00 p.m. and
6:00 a.m. during the months of June through September and between the hours of 6:00 p.m. and
7:00 a.m. during the months of October through May. Exceptions to these standards shall be
allowed only with the written consent of the building official.

2. Thegeneration of construction noise other than aspermitted in Section 1.G.1 of this Ordinance,
shall be a violation of this Ordinance, and the building official or his designee shall have the
authority to undertake enforcement actions in accordance with the procedures, remedies and
penalties for violations as provided for in Riverside County Ordinance No. 725, which is
incorporated herein by reference.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

SECTION 2
UNIFORM ADMINISTRATIVE CODE

SECTION 2.

The Uniform Administrative Code, 1994 Edition, as adopted by the International Conference of Building
Officials, is hereby adopted and made a part of this Ordinance by reference (three copies of which are onfile
for use by the public in the office of the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors) with the following modifications:

A. Boardsof Appedl:

1.

Section 204.1 of the Uniform Administrative Code is amended to read: in order to determine
the suitability of alternate materials and methods of construction and to provide for reasonable
interpretations of the technical codes, six Boards of Appeal, consisting of members who are
gualified by education, experience and training to pass upon matters pertaining to the hereinafter
listed fields of construction are hereby created. The members of each Board shall be appointed
by the Board of Supervisors and shall hold office at its pleasure. The members of each Board
shall annually elect a chairman of each Board of Appedl.

Each Board shall consist of five members of the following fields of construction:

Structural: Two General Contractors; one Structural Engineer; one Architect; one Material
Supplier.

Grading: Two Grading Contractors; one Civil Engineer; one Soils Engineer; one Testing
Laboratory.

Mechanical: Two Heating, Ventilating and Air Conditioning Contractors, one Mechanical
Engineer; one Architect; one Mechanical Equipment Supplier.

Plumbing: Two Plumbing Contractors, one Mechanical Engineer; one Architect; one
Plumbing Supplier.

Electrical: Two Electrical Contractors; one Electrical Engineer; one Electrical Utility; one

Electric Supplier.
Disabled Two members who shall be physically disabled as defined
Access. In Section 417(n), Title 24, Part 2 of the California Code of Regulations; two

members experienced in construction; and one public member.

The Disabled Access Appeal Board shall serve asthe “local appeals board” specified in Section
19957.5 of the Health and Safety Codefor appealsrelating to accommodationsfor the physically
disabled. The Board shall have the ability to approve or disapprove interpretations of the
physically disabled access requirements set forth in Title 24, Part 2 of the California Code of
Regulations and enforcement actions taken by the Department of Building and Safety including
any exceptions granted pursuant to Section 19957 of the Health and Safety Code. All such
approvals of disapprovals by this Board shall be final and conclusive as to the Department of
Building and Safety in the absence of fraud or prejudicial abuse of discretion. The Board shall
also adopt regulations establishing procedural rulesand criteriafor the carrying out of itsduties.

Any person that is aggrieved by a decision of the building official may appeal to the Board of
Appeal for the field in question by filing a written notice of appeal upon the form provided by
the Department of Building and Safety within ten days after the date of the decision. The effect
of the order or determination appealed from is suspended until the termination of the hearing.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

5

5. The Board of Appeal shal fix the time and place of hearing the appeal which shall not be less
than five nor more than twenty days after the date of filing of the appeal, and shall give written
notice of the time and place of the hearing to the appellant and the building official. Witnesses
may be sworn and examined and evidence produced by the interested parties who shall appear

in person only. The Board shall keep arecord of each appeal and the proceedings thereunder.

6. TheBoard shal prepare written findings and conclusions within five days after the close of the
hearing and make its recommendations to the building official based upon such findings and
conclusions. The affirmative vote of three or more members of the Board shall constitute the
recommendation of the Board. The failure to prepare findings shall constitute the
recommendation of theBoard. Thefailureto preparefindingsshall constitutearecommendation
approving the determination of the building official.

Section 301.2.1 of the Uniform Administrative Code isamended by adding thereto anew subsection
to read:

12. Agricultural Buildings, as defined in Section 202 of the Uniform Building Code, which are open
on two or more sides.

Whenever an agricultural building that does not require a building permit is constructed, a
Registration Certificate shall be obtained from the Department of Building and Safety prior to the
start of construction. The certificate shall be issued on payment of a $30.00 fee and shall show the
location, nature and estimated cost of construction.

Tables 3-A, 3-B, 3-C, 3-D, 3-E, 3-F, 3-G, and 3-H of the Uniform Administrative Code are deleted.
Section 303.4 of the Uniform Administrative Code is amended to read:

303.4. Expiration. Every permit issued by the building official under the provisions of the technical
codes shall expire by limitation and become null and void, if the building or work authorized by such
permit is not commenced and a written request for inspection filed with the building official within
45 days for demolition permits and for permits for previously un-permitted construction, within 45
days for plans submitted for relocation, rehabilitation and fire damage special inspection permits, or
within 180 day for all other permits from the date of issuance of the permit. If the building or work
authorized by such permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work is commenced for
aperiod of 180 days, or 45 days for demolition permits and for permits for previously un-permitted
construction, such permit shall expire by limitation and become null and void. Work shall be deemed
suspended or abandoned if at any time more than 180 days, or 45 daysfor demolition permitsand for
permits for previousdly un-permitted construction, elapses between the filing of written requests for
inspection with the building official. Before work can be recommenced on a project for which the
permit has expired, a new permit shall first be obtained to do so, and the fee therefore shall be
determined by using the approved hourly rate for the activity permitted. The specific amount of the
fee shall be determined by the Building Official and shall be based on the estimated number of hours
needed to complete the inspection or the plan checking of the permitted work. If there has been a
major code change between the original permit date and the request for arenewal, the fees will be
charged for the time necessary to verify code compliance with the new building codesthat have been
adopted since the initial permit was issued. A magjor code change is defined as the adoption by
Riverside County through Ordinance No. 457 of an updated edition of the Uniform Building Code,
Uniform Housing Code, Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, Uniform
Mechanical Code, Uniform Plumbing Code, the Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code,
the National Electric Code or the Uniform Code for Building Conservation.

Any permittee holding an unexpired permit may apply for an extension of time within which he may
commence work under that permit when heis unable to commence work within the time required by
this section for good and satisfactory reasons. The building officia or his designee may grant such




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

6
extensions of time upon written request of the permittee for a period not exceeding 180 days, or 45
days for demolition, relocation, rehabilitation, or fire damage special inspection permits. No permit
shall be extended more than once.

Section 304.2 of the Uniform Administrative Code is amended to read:

The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in Appendix | and Tables 3-A, 3-B, 3-C, 3-D, 3-E, 3-F,
3-G, and 3-H of thisOrdinance. The minimum fee for any permit requiring field inspection shall be
one hour at the fully burdened hourly rate, not including the permit processing fee. The cost to
process any permit is 15 minutes of Counter Services rate, which shall be established through the
yearly budget process and adopted by the Board of Supervisors as part of the County Budget
hearings. Thefeespaid for singlefamily dwelling plan review and building permitsand for al grading
plan review and grading permits shall be treated as a deposit. The specific fee deposits shall be as
follows:

Plan Review:
Individual Single Family Dwelling = 100% of the fee set forth above
Model Plans = 175% of the fee set forth above

Repeat Plans based on Models $75.00
Building Permits:

Individual Single Family Dwelling
Permits Based on Model Plans
(Tract Housing)

100% of the fee set forth above
75% of the fee set forth above

Grading Plan Review: = 100% of fee set forth above
Grading Permits: = 100% of fee set forth above

Feescollected in excess of the actual cost of providing the specific service shall berefunded. Permits
whose work require a cost to the department beyond the estimated fee collected as a deposit shall
require an additional deposit. Work on any plan review or building permit will cease when the
deposit is depleted and will resume when additional deposits are received.

The County will make draws against deposited funds at the fully burdened hourly rates for each job
classification required to provide the specified service. Hourly ratesfor services shall be established
through the annual budget process and adopted by the Board of Supervisors as part of the County
Budget hearings.

Depositsfor plan review will be collected upon submittal of an application for plan review. Deposits
will be monitored and when 80% depleted, an analysis will be done to determine if the remaining
portion of the deposit will cover expected project completion costs. If costs are expected to exceed
the remaining deposit, additional deposits will be required to be submitted to recover the estimated
full cost for plan review completion. Additional deposits will be determined on a case by case basis
based on the estimated cost to complete the plan review.

A full accounting of each plan review will be made within 30 days of completion of the plan review
process and provided to the applicant. Remaining plan review deposits will be held and added to the
building permit deposit, unless a request for refund is made by the applicant.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

7
Depositsfor building permits will be collected upon requests for the issuance of the building permit.
Deposits will be monitored and when 80% depleted, an analysis of the project will be done to
determine if the remaining portion of the deposit will cover expected project completion costs. If
costs are expected to exceed the remaining deposit, additional deposits will be required to be
submitted to ensure recovery of the full cost for project completion. Additional deposits will be
determined on a case by case basis based on the estimated cost to complete the project.

A full accounting of each permit will be made within 30 days of final inspection and provided to the
applicant. All remaining deposit funds will then be refunded to the applicant.

When it is mutually agreed by the applicant and the Transportation and Land Management Agency
Director (“ Director”) or the Department of Building and Safety (“ Department”), any fees for plan
reviews and building permitsfor other than single family dwellings may be treated and accounted for
as deposit-based fees in the manner established herein above and in the initial deposit amounts as
determined in the discretion of the Director of Department.

PERMIT FEE APPEALS PROCESS:

Within 10 calendar days of receipt of the full accounting of the plan review/building permit costs or
request for additional deposits, the applicant may request areview of thematter by the Transportation
and Land Management Agency (TLMA) Director, or his’her designee, who shall along with the
Building and Safety representative, review the cost of performing the plan review/building permit
services. The TLMA Director may, in his’/her sole discretion, determine that the costs were or were
not appropriate and may then reduce the costs charged. The TLMA Director shal, inwriting, notify
the appealing person of his’her decision within three working days.

Any responsible party aggrieved by the decision of the TLMA Director, or higher designee, may
withinten (10) calendar days after the date of mailing of the TLMA Director’ sdecision, fileawritten
appeal of the decision with the Administrative Review Board. This appeal shal be filed with the
TLMA Adminigtration. The Administrative Review Board shall be composed of representatives of
TLMA, EDA, and two building industry representatives, one each fromthewestern and eastern parts
of the County. Inaddition, afifth member of the board shall be selected by the previously mentioned
representatives, based on the expertise needed on the board. This Administrative Review Board will
convene within 10 working days of the filing of the appeal.

ThisAdministrative Review Board will review the cost of performing the plan review/building permit
serviceswhich may includeinformation provided orally or inwritten form by the applicant and agency
staff. The Administrative Review board may determine that the costs were or were not appropriate
and may then reduce the costs charged. The Administrative Review Board shall, in writing, notify
the appealing person of his’her decision within three working days.

Any responsible party aggrieved by the decision of the Administrative Review Board, may withinten
(10) calendar days after the date of mailing of the Administrative Review Board’s decision, file a
written appeal of the decision with the Board of Supervisors. The appeal shall be on the form(s)
provided by the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors and shall be accompanied by afiling fee of $50.
Upon receipt of the completed appeal with filing fees, the Clerk of the Board shall set the matter for
hearing before the Board of Supervisors not less than ten (10) nor more than thirty (30) days
thereafter and shall give written notice of the hearing to the applicant and the TLMA Director. The
Board of Supervisors shall render its decision within thirty (30) days following the close of the
hearing of the appeal.

Unless appealed, the decision of the TLMA Director isfina. If the decision of the TLMA Director
is appealed, then the decision of the Administrative Review Board is final. If the decison of the
Administrative Review Board is appealed, then the decision of the Board of Supervisorsis final.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

8
Work on any plan check or building permit may continue during any appeal process provided there
are sufficient funds on deposit.

Section 304.3 of the Uniform Administrative Code is amended to read:

When a plan or other data are required to be submitted by Section 302.2, a plan review fee shal be
paid at the time of submitting plans and specifications for review. The plan review fee for buildings
or structures shall be seventy-five percent of the building permit fee.

Where plansor other dataareincomplete or changed so asto require additional review, an additional
minimum one-half hour fee at the approved rate shall be charged for thefirst half hour and for each
half hour thereafter.

Section 304.5.1 and 304.5.2 of the Uniform Administrative Code are amended to read:
304.5 Investigation Fees. Work Without a Permit.

1. Investigation. Whenever work for which apermit isrequired by this code has been commenced
without first obtaining a permit, an investigation shall be conducted before a permit may be
issued for such work.

2. Fee. An investigation fee, hereinafter referred to as “administrative costs’ as defined by
Riverside County Ordinance No. 725, Section 1.e, shall be collected prior to the issuance of any
permit for work commenced without first obtaining therequired permit. Theadministrative cost
shall be calculated as provided for in Riverside County Ordinance No. 725, Section l1.e. |
through V, and shall not be based upon the permit fee as established by this code.

Section 304.6 of the Uniform Administrative Code is amended to read:

The building official may authorize refunding of afee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or
collected.

The building official may authorize during the term of the permit, the refunding of not more than 80
percent of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with
this code; however, a minimum of $23.39 shall not be refunded on any permit.

Thebuilding official may authorize during the term of the plan review, the refunding of not morethan
80 percent of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance
with this code; however, a minimum of $23.39 shall not be refunded on any permit.

When property for which a permit for a project has been issued is annexed to a city and the County
losesjurisdiction thereof before the project is completed, the portion of any fees collected under any
section of this Ordinance in excess of expenses of the building official may be refunded upon the
recommendation of the building official and the approval of the Board of Supervisors. The
application for refund shall be made upon the usual form of claim against the County, and the action
of the building official shall be stated thereon along with the amount approved for refund.

Notwithstanding the foregoing, any fee collected under any section of this Ordinance for the State
of California shall not be refunded by the County of Riverside.

The following provisions are added to Section 304 of the Uniform Administrative Code:
304.7. Performance Bonds. As a condition to the issuance of a permit for any project involving

demolition, rehabilitation, or special inspection, the building official may require the posting of a
performance bond in an amount which the building official, in his discretion, deems sufficient to




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

assure timely performance and completion of the project for which the permit is issued.

The permit applicant shall satisfy the requirement of posting a performance bond by providing any
of the types of security specified in Section 19835 of the Health and Safety Code.

The performance bond shall bereleased upon completion, final inspection, and approval of the project
for which the permit isissued. All or part of the performance bond may be released earlier, in the
discretion of the building official.

304.8. When plansare submitted that require asideyard agreement an additional fee of $621.00 shall
be paid.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

10
SECTION 3

SUBSTANDARD, DANGEROUS OR UNSAFE BUILDINGS,
STRUCTURES OR BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT
SECTION 3.

The Uniform Housing Code, and the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1994
editions, as adopted by the International Conference of Building Officials, are hereby adopted and made a
part of this Ordinance by reference (three copies of each code are on file for use by the public in the office
of the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors), with the following modifications:

A. Dedletions:

1. Chapters2, 4,5, 6, 7, 8, and 9 of the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings
are deleted.

2. Chapters 2, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, and 16 of the Uniform Housing Code are deleted.

B. Abatement of Unsafe, Dangerous, and Substandard Buildings, Structures and Building Service
Equipment. The following procedures are added to the Uniform Housing Code and the Uniform
Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings to abate unsafe, dangerous and substandard
buildings, structures, and building service equipment:

1. Public Nuisance. Every unsafe, dangerous and substandard building, structure, or building
service equipment as defined in Section 17920.3 of the Health and Safety Code and further
defined in Section 203 of the Uniform Administrative code, Chapter 10 of the Uniform Housing
Code and Chapter 3 of the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings is hereby
declared to be a public nuisance which shall be abated by repair, rehabilitation, demolition or
removal in accordance with the procedure contained in this section.

2. Summary Abatement. Pursuant to Government Code Section 25845(a), the building official or
his designee is hereby authorized to summarily abate public nuisances which he or his designee
has determined constitute an immediate threat to public health or safety. Summary abatement
authority shall include the right of the building official or his designee to take immediate interim
remedial measures to mitigate, secure or make safe the immediate threat to public health and
safety.

3. First Notice. The building official, upon determining that a building, a structure or building
service equipment is unsafe or substandard shall post a copy of the notice of defectsin aplainly
visible place on the building structure or building service equipment and shall personally serve
or send a copy, by registered or certified mail, postage prepaid, return receipt requested to the
owner of the land on which the building, structure or building service equipment is located, as
such person’ sname and address appear onthelast County equalized assessment roll, also to each
mortgagee or beneficiary under any deed of trust that is of record, to the holder of any lease that
is of record; and to the record holder of any other estate or interest in the building, structure or
building service equipment or the land upon which such building structure or building service
equipment islocated, at the last known addresses of such interest holders. If the address of any
such personis unknown, that fact shall be stated in the copy so mailed, and it shall be addressed
to the person at the County Seat. Service by mail shal be deemed complete at the time of
deposit inthe mails. The notice shall specify the conditions which render the building, structure
or building service equipment unsafe or substandard, and if in the opinion of the building officia
such conditions can be corrected by repair, the notice shall state the work that is necessary to
repair or rehabilitate the building, structure or building service equipment. The notice shall
require the owner to obtain al necessary permits from the Department of Building and Safety
and to correct or abate the unsafe or substandard conditions either by repair, demolition or




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

11
removal within 30 days after the date of notice. If a building, structure or building service
equipment or the land upon which such building, structure or building service equipment is
located is encumbered by a mortgage or deed of trust of record, and the owner shall not have
complied with the order on or before the expiration of 30 days after the mailing and posting of
the notice, the mortgagee or beneficiary under the deed of trust may within 15 days after the
expiration of the 30-day period, comply with the requirements of the notice.

The building official shall file a copy of the Notice of Defects with the Clerk of the Board of
Supervisors along with an affidavit certifying to the persons, date and manner in which such
notice was given. He shall also thereafter file any receipt cards which are returned to him
acknowledging receipt of the notice. The failure of any owner or other personsto receive such
notice shall not affect in any manner the validity of any proceedings taken thereunder.

Order to Vacate. Whenever in the opinion of the building official extreme and imminent hazard
exists, he shall give written notice ordering the occupants of any such building to immediately
vacate, and in the event compliance with the order is not voluntarily and promptly obtained, he
shall request the law enforcement agency having jurisdiction to effect such a vacation or
forthwith take such action at law asisrequired to cause the premisesto be vacated. A copy of
the ORDER TO VACATE, which shal include the reasons for the order, shall be posted on the
building and mailed to all concerned parties and filed with the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors
in the same manner as the notice of defects. Upon giving such order to vacate, the building
official shall cause to be posted at each entrance to the building a notice to read: “ DANGER -
DO NOT ENTER OR OCCUPY, Building Official, County of Riverside”. Such notices shall
remain posted until the required repair, demolition or removal are completed. Such notice shall
not be removed without written permission of the building official, and no person shall enter the
building except for the purpose of making the required repairs or the demolition of the building,
without the written permission of the building official.

Notice of Pendency of Proceedings. Whenever notice of defects has been given, the building
official shall record in the office of the County Recorder of Riverside County, a notice that an
administrative proceeding has been commenced for the abatement of a public nuisance,
describing thereal property affected and stating that the costsincurred therein may becomealien
on said property, and directing any inquiry for further details to his office, giving the address
thereof.

Second Notice. If the order of the building official in the first notice shall not have been
complied withwithin 45 days after receipt of said notice by all parties concerned, asecond notice
shall be given by posting and mailing inthe same manner asthefirst notice which shall be entitled
in letters not less than three-fourths of aninchin height, “ NOTICE TO ABATE NUISANCE.”
The notice shall direct the owner of the building structure or building service equipment to
appear at a hearing before the Board of Supervisors at a stated date, time and place to show
cause why such building, structure or building service equipment should not be condemned as
anuisance and be abated as herein provided. The hearing shall be set not lessthan 15 days after
the posting and mailing of the notice by the building official. The building official shall file a
copy of the notice and an affidavit of service with the Clerk of the Board of Supervisorsinthe
same manner as the first notice, but the failure of any owner or other person to receive such
notice shall not affect in any manner the validity of any proceedings taken hereunder.

Hearing. At the time fixed in the notice, the Board of Supervisors shall proceed to hear the
testimony of the building official and the owner of the building, structure or building service
equipment or hisrepresentativesif present at said hearing, and other concerned partieswho may
desireto testify regarding the condition of the building, structure or building service equipment,
the estimated cost of reconstruction repair or removal, and any other relevant matter. Uponthe
conclusion of hearing, the Board shall make its decision, and in the event that it so concludes,
it may declare the building, structure or building service equipment to be a nuisance, and direct




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

10.

11.

12.

12
the owner to abate the same by having the building, structure or building service equipment
properly reconstructed or repaired, or by having it razed or removed, and further notifying the
owner that if said nuisanceis not abated within 90 days after posting and mailing of the Board's
decision, the building, structure or building service equipment will be razed or removed by the
County of Riverside, and the expense thereof shall be alien on the lot or parcel of land upon
which the building, structure or building service equipment islocated. At any timewithintheten
days after the Board’ s decision directing the abatement of a nuisance, the building official shall
post a copy of the Board' sdecision on the building, structure or building service equipment and
mail copies thereof to al parties concerned in the same manner as the first notice, and he shall
file an affidavit thereof with the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors. The Board may grant any
extension of time to abate said nuisance that it may deem justifiable upon good cause being
shown.

Time to Bring Action. Unless the owner or holder of an interest of record brings an action in
a court of competent jurisdiction within 90 days after the date of mailing and posting on said
premises of the notice of the decision of the Board, contesting the validity of any proceedings
leading up to and including the decision of the Board, all objections to the proceedings and
decision will be deemed to have been waived.

Jurisdiction to Abate. Ninety days after the mailing and posting of the Board’s decision, the
County shal have jurisdiction to abate such nuisance by razing or removing the building,
structure or building service equipment, unless within the 90-day period an extension of timeis
granted by the Board. Intheevent that the nuisanceisnot abated within the prescribed time, the
County may thereupon raze or remove the building, structure or building service equipment or
have the same done under its direction and supervision.

Sale of Materials. The building materials contained in such building, structure or building
service equipment so razed or removed may be sold by the building official at public saleto the
highest responsible bidder after not less than five days notice of intended sale published at least
once in awhile newspaper of general circulation published in the County either before or after
a building, structure or building service equipment has been razed or removed and any amount
received from the sale of such materials shall be deducted from the expense of razing or
removing the building, structure or building service equipment. The building official shall keep
an itemized account of the expenses involved in the razing or removing and shall deduct
therefrom any amount received from the sale of the building materials. If the building official
determines that there will be no materials that are saleable, he shall not advertise for bids.

Statement of Expense. The building official shall cause to be posted conspicuously on the
property fromwhichthebuilding, structure of building service equipment wasrazed or removed,
averified statement showing the gross and net expense of the razing and removing and al other
costs, together with a notice of the date, time and place when and where the statement shall be
heard by the Board, which shall be not less than five days after the posting and mailing of the
statement. A copy of the statement and notice shall be mailed to all concerned partiesin the
manner asis prescribed for the first notice and filed with the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors
together with an affidavit of posting and mailing.

Hearing on Statement of Expense. At thetimefixed for the hearing on the statement of expense
the Board shall consider the statement, together with any objections or protests which may be
raised by the property owner or other concerned parties. The Board may make such revision,
correction or modification in the statement as it may deem just, and thereafter shall render its
decision on the statement. The Board’s decision on the statement and on al protests and
objections which may be made shall be final and conclusive.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

13
Payment-Lien. If payment is not made within ten days after the Board's decision on the
statement, the building official shall transmit the statement and the Board's decision to the
County Auditor who shall place the amount thereof on the assessment roll as a specid
assessment to be paid with County taxes unless sooner paid. At the same time, the building
official shall file in the office of the County Recorder of Riverside County a notice of lien,
describing the real property affected, a summary of the action taken to abate the nuisance and
the amount of the lien claimed by the County of Riverside.

Release of Lien. Upon payment infull of the costs of the abatement proceeding and the expense
of the work done, or upon order of the Board of Supervisors, the building official shall execute
and record with the County Recorder a release of the recorded lien on the property. If an
assessment has been placed on the assessment roll and is thereafter paid to the building officidl,
he shall notify the County Auditor who shall cancel the assessment on the roll.

Intheevent that the amount received fromasale of materials exceedsthe expenses of abatement,
such excess shall be deposited with the County Treasurer to the credit of the owner of the
property or to such other person legally entitled thereto, and such excess shall be payable to the
owner or other person upon producing evidence of ownership satisfactory to the Treasurer.

Thebuilding official isauthorized to pay from funds appropriated to himthe cost of atitle search
to determine who are the concerned parties, mailing expense, and expense of al work done or
caused to be done by him in the summary abatement, repair, rehabilitation, demolition, or
removal of abuilding or structure under this section. All of such costs shall be included in the
statement of expense filed by the building official.

The Board may continue any hearing provided for herein from time to time. Upon the close of
a hearing, the Board shall render its decision not later than 15 days thereafter.

Other Remedies. Nothing herein shal preclude the use by the County of Riverside or any
person adversely affected, of any other remedy civil, criminal or otherwise, for the abatement of
anuisance instead of or in addition to any of the provisions of this section.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

14
SECTION 4
UNIFORM BUILDING CODE

SECTION 4.

The Uniform Building Code, 1994 edition, including the Appendix, California State Amendments, and the
Standards referred to in Chapter 35 of the Uniform Building Code, as adopted by the Internationa
Conference of Building Officials is hereby adopted and made a part of this Ordinance by reference (three
copies of which are on file for use and examination by the public in the office of the Clerk of the Board of
Supervisors) with the following modifications:

A.
B.

Chapter 1, Sections 102 through 109; and Appendix 13 of the Uniform Building Code are deleted.

The first paragraph of Section 1609.2 is amended to read:

1609.2 RETAINING WALL DESIGN. Retaining walls shall be designed to resist the lateral
pressure of the retained material determined in accordance with accepted engineering principles.

1.

The soil characteristics and design criteria necessary for such a determination shall be obtained
from ageotechnical investigation by asoilsengineer, subject to approval by the building official.
Exceptions. Freestanding wallsnot over 15'in height or basement wallswith spansof 15' or less
between supports, are exempt from this criteria. They may be designed in accordance with
Subsection 2 of this section

TABLE NO. 16-D

SURFACE SLOPE OF RETAINED EQUIVALENT FLUID
MATERIAL* HORIZ. TO VERT. WEIGHT (LB/FT3)

LEVEL 30

5t01 32

4to1 35

3tol 38

2tol 43

1% to 1 55

ltol 80

*Where the surface dope of the retained earth varies, the design slope shall be obtained by
connecting a line from the top of the wall to the highest point on the slope, which limits are
within the horizontal distance from the stem equal to the stem height of the wall.

ARBITRARY DESIGN METHOD. Wallswhichretaindrained earthand comewithinthelimits
of the exception to Subsection 1 of this section, may be designed for an assumed earth pressure
equivalent to that exerted by afluid weighing not less than that shown in Table No. 16-D. A
vertical compound equal to one-third of the Horizontal Force so obtained may be assumed at the
plane of application of the Force. The depth of retained earth shall be the vertical distance
below the ground surface measured at the wall face for stem design or measured at the heel of
the footing for overturning and dliding.

SURCHARGE. Any superimposed loading, except retained earth, shall be considered as
surcharge and provided for in the design. Uniformly distributed loads may be considered as
equivalent added depth of retained earth. Surcharge loading due to continuous or isolated
footings shall be determined by the following formulas or by an equivalent method approved by
the building official.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

15
Resultant Lateral Force:
R=0.3ph?/(x2 + h?)

Location of Lateral Resultant:
d = x[x&/h2+1) (Arc Tan (h/X) - (x/h)]

Where:
R= Resultant Lateral Force measured in pounds per foot of wall width.
P= Resultant Surcharge Load of continuous or isolated footings measured in pounds per foot of

length parallel to the wall.

= Distance of resultant load from the back face of wall measured in feet.

= Depth below point of application of surcharge loading to top of footing measured in feet.

= Depth of Lateral resultant below point of application of surcharge loading measured in feet.
Arc Tan (h/x) = The angle in Radians whose tangent is equal to (h/x).

Load applied within aHorizontal distance equal to thewall stem height, measured fromthe back face
of thewall, shall be considered as surcharge. For isolated footings having awidth parallel to the wall
of lessthanthreefeet, “R” may bereduced to 1/6 the calculated value. Theresultant lateral force“R”
shall be assumed to be uniform for the length of the footing parallel to the wall, and to diminish
uniformly to zero at the distance “x” beyond the ends of the footing. Vertical pressure due to
surcharge applied to the top of the wall footing may be considered to spread uniformly within the
limits of the stem and planes, making an angle of 45 degrees with the vertical.

4. BEARING PRESSURE AND OVERTURNING. The maximum vertical bearing pressure
under any retaining wall shall not exceed that allowed in Table 18-1-A. Uniform Building Code,
except as provided for by a special geotechnical investigation.

5. FRICTION AND LATERAL SOIL PRESSURE. Theretainingwall shall berestrained against
diding by thelateral dliding resistance of the base against the earth, by lateral bearing of the soil,
or by a combination of the two. Allowable lateral bearing and latera diding resistance values
shall not exceed those values allowed in Table 18-1-A, except as provided for in a special
geotechnical investigation. When used, Keys shall be assumed to lower the plane of lateral
diding resistance and the depth of lateral bearing to the level of the bottom of the key. Lateral
bearing pressure shall be assumed to act as a vertical plane located at the toe of the footing.

6. CONSTRUCTION. No retaining walls shall be constructed of wood unless specifically
approved by the building official pursuant to Section 105 of the Uniform Administrative Code.

Section 2311.6 of the Uniform Building Code is amended by adding the following sentence:

All trusses will be stamped by the manufacturer’ s name and approva number of the quality control
agency doing the implant inspections.

Chapter 19 (Volume 2) of the Uniform Building Code is amended by adding the following section:
1928. Ready-Mix Concrete.

(@) No concrete batch plant shal supply ready-mixed concrete to any person for use in a
construction project in the unincorporated area of the County of Riverside which requires the
issuance of apermit pursuant to this ordinance without a permit-to-supply issued by the building
official. A concrete batch plant shall be defined for purposes of this ordinance as the business
of manufacturing ready-mix concrete for sale to the public. The permit-to-supply shall consist
of (1) a batch plant certification, and (2) a valid concrete mix design registration for the
concrete mix being supplied to such construction projects. A Batch Plant certification shall be
performed by the Transportation Department Materials Laboratory, and shall be valid for a




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

(b)

(©)

(d)

(€)

16
period of four years. A Batch Plant certification fee shal be paid to the Transportation
Department in accordance with the provisions of Riversde County Ordinance No. 671. A
concrete mix design certified by a qualified, registered civil engineer as complying with the
provisions set forth in Chapter 19 of the Uniform Building Code, shall be submitted to the
Transportation Department for registration. A concrete mix design registration fee shall be paid
to the Transportation Department in accordance with the provisions of Riverside County
Ordinance No. 671. The following provisions apply to each concrete mix design requiring this
registration:

1. A concrete mix designs used at more than one batch plant must be individually registered for
each plant supplying the concrete mix design.

2. A concrete mix design registration shall be valid for the duration of the current concrete
batch plant certification period, unlessthe source of raw materials or the concrete mix design
is changed.

3. All registered concrete mix designs must bere-registered with each renewal of concrete plant
certification. However, mixesno longer in use need not bere-registered and shall beremoved
from the registration list upon expiration of the concrete batch plant certification.

Each concrete mix design submitted for registration must include an information packet

containing the following information:

The trade or firm name of the concrete batch plant.

The address or location of the concrete batch plant.

The identification number of the concrete mix design.

A complete description of the composition of each concrete mix design being submitted for

registration.

The sources of al of the raw materials used in the concrete mix design.

Copiesof any test results which show that the concrete mix design product complieswith the

provisions of Chapter 19 of the Uniform Building Code.

A letter signed by aqualified, registered civil engineer specifically identifying each mix design

submitted and stating that the concrete batch plant raw materials and design specifications

comply with the provisions of Chapter 19 of the Uniform Building Code. If concrete

proportions are based on water-cement ratio limits, in accordance with Chapter 19 and Table

19-A-7 of the Uniform Building Code, a letter signed by the concrete batch plant manager

may be acceptable.

8. A sampledelivery ticket showing how and where each item listed under Subsection (f) below
will be recorded on the delivery ticket.

N O og h~owDNE

The applicant shall keep current all information required to be supplied to the Transportation
Department and shall make no change in source of material or concrete mix designs without re-
registering pursuant to the provisions of this section.

A permit to supply ready-mixed concrete may be revoked by the Board of Supervisors upon
recommendation and determination of the building official, that a permittee has supplied ready-
mixed concrete that does not meet the standards set forth in this ordinance, to any personinthe
unincorporated areaof the County of Riverside, unless such concrete was specifically requested
by the person to whom the concrete was furnished.

TypeV cement shall be used in any concrete in contact with the soil inthe CoachellaValley area
of the County of Riverside. The CoachellaValley area shall be defined as all that area west of
the Coachella branch of the All American Canal, south of Avenue 40 and east of Washington
Street.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

17

(f) A delivery ticket issued by alicensed weighmaster, certifying the quantities of all materials used

in each batch of ready-mixed concrete at the concrete batch plant, shall be provided for the
purchaser by the concrete batch plant supplier. This delivery ticket shall include the following
items of information:

The trade of firm name of the concrete batch plant.

The address or location of the concrete batch plant.

The identification number of the concrete mix design.

The cement content of the ready-mix concrete in sacks/cubic yard and the compressive
strength of the concrete product.

Total water content of ready-mix concrete at the concrete batch plant, in gallons.
Additional water that can be added to the ready-mix concrete at the delivery site in gallons.
Actual gallons of water added to the ready-mix concrete at the delivery site.

Ready-mix concrete placement location (i.e.: tract, lot number, addressor some other specific
placement location identification).

9. Name and address of the purchaser receiving the concrete.

ONOOT A~AWNE

(9) All concrete batch plant suppliers of the ready-mixed concrete subject to the provisions of this

ordinance shall furnish to the building official, laboratory test reports on al materials used for
concrete, upon notice that performance of finished concrete is below that for which it was
designed.

E. Section 1805 of the Uniform Building Code is amended by adding the following sentence:

Design criteria for Class 4 materials, as described in Table 18-1-A, shall be used for structures
(residential/commercial) and retaining walls where no preliminary soils report has been submitted.

F. Section 1806.1 of the Uniform Building Code is amended by adding to the end thereof a new
paragraph to read:

Finish grade shall be doped to provide proper drainage away from all exterior foundationwalls. The
dope shall be not less than one-half inch per foot for a distance of not less than three feet from any
point of exterior foundation. Drainage swales shall not be less than 1%z inches deeper than the
adjacent finished grade at the foundation.

G. Section 1806.4.6 of the Uniform Building Code is amended by adding the following paragraphs:

1.

Setbacks between graded dopes (cut or fill) and structures or masonry walls shall be in
accordance with Figure 18-1-1: except that lopes steeper than two horizontal to one vertical or
greater than 30 feet in vertical height shall be setback a distance determined by a dope stability
analysisprepared by aRegistered Civil Engineer, which shall provide adequate protectionfor the
structurein case of dopefailure. Natura dopessteeper than four horizontal to one vertical shall
observe the same setbacks as graded slopes: unless an alternate method is approved by the
Grading Engineer.

Figure #18-1-1 is amended to read as follows:

a. Wherever “ H/2 but need not exceed 15' max.” appears, isamended to read “ H/2 but 5' min.
and 15' max. except as amended by Section 1806.4.6".

b. Wherever “ H/3 but need not exceed 40' max.” appears, is amended to read “ H/3 but 5' min.
and 40" max. except as amended by Section 1806.4.6".




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

18

H. Fire-Extinguishing equipment of the following types shall be provided in all restaurant cooking
appliance ventilation systems:

1.
2.

An approved fixed pipe inert gas system operated by manual and automatic controls or,

An approved fixed pipe dry chemical system operated by manual and automatic control.

I.  Specia Construction Provisions for Hazardous Fire Areas. The hazardous fire areas of the
unincorporated area of the County of Riverside are those portions so designed on the maps entitled,
“Hazardous Fire Areas of Riverside County”, on file in the office of the Clerk of the Board of
Supervisors and in the office of the County Fire Warden of Riverside County. All buildings or
structures that are constructed or moved into hazardous fire areas, shall comply with the following
construction requirements:

1.

1.

Roof Coverings. Roof covering shall be fire retardant roofing as specified in Section 1504.1,
.2, and .3 of the Uniform Building Code or other fire retardant roofing that has been tested by
the Underwriters Laboratory or other recognized testing agency and accepted by the
International Conference of Building Officials.

Protection of Openings. Openings into attics, floors or other enclosed areas shall be covered
with corrosion-resistant wire mesh not greater than ¥sinch in any dimension unless such
openings are equipped with sash or doors.

Alterations. Existing buildings and structures in high fire hazard areas to which additions,
aterationsor reparsare made, shall comply with these special provisonsin accordancewiththe
provisions of Section 102 of the Uniform Administrative Code.

Appendix. Chapter 33 of the Uniform Building Code Appendix is amended as follows:

Section 3304 of the Uniform Building Code is amended to read:

Section 3304. The purpose of this chapter is to safeguard life, limb, property and the public
welfare by regulating grading on private property. Road work that is being regulated by the
Director of Transportation by County contract or through Ordinance Nos. 460, 461 and 499
shall not be required to obtain a grading permit pursuant to this chapter.

Sections 3306 of the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows:

Section 3306.1. Permits Required. No person shall conduct any grading or clearing without

first obtaining a grading permit from the building official except when the grading or clearing

resultsin, is performed in connection with, or is for the following:

1.  Anexcavation below finished grade for basements and footings of a building, retaining
wall or other structure authorized by avalid building permit. This shall not except any fill
made with the material from such excavating nor except any excavation having an
unsupported height greater than 5 feet after the completion of such structure.

2.  Cemetery graves.

3. Refusedisposal sites controlled by other regulations.

4. Excavations for wells or tunnels or utilities.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

10.

11.

12.

13.

19
Mining, quarrying, excavating, processing, stockpiling of rock, sand, gravel, aggregate or
clay where established and provided for by law, provided such operationsdo not affect the
lateral support or increase the stresses in or pressure upon any adjacent or contiguous

property.
Exploratory excavations under the direction of soil engineers or engineering geologists.

An excavation which does not exceed 50 cubic yards on any one lot and which, (a) isless
than 2 feet in depth, or (b) which does not create a cut slope greater than 5 feet in height
and steeper than 1Y horizontal to 1 vertical. This exemption shall not apply when finish
grading is proposed, subsequent to apermit authorizing rough grading in accordance with
Section 4.J.4(a).

A fill less than 1 foot in depth and placed on natural terrain with a dope flatter than 5
horizontal to 1 vertical, or less than 3 feet in depth, not intended to support structures,
which does not exceed 50 cubic yards on any one lot and does not obstruct a drainage
course. Thisexemption shall not apply when finish grading is proposed, subsequent to a
permit authorizing grading in accordance with Section 4.J.4(a).

The construction or maintenance of roads or facilities for the generation, storage or
transmission of water including floodwatersor electrical energy by public agenciesor their
agents.

The maintenance of private roads by private individuals or their agents, but not the
construction or widening of such roads.

Fire protection within that area specified in any annual weed abatement notice or hazard
reduction notice or such additional areaas maybe authorized or required, inwriting, by the
appropriatefire protection agency or asprovided in Section 405 of County Ordinance No.
546.

Uses incidental to an existing residence such as fencing, gardening, corralling, or
landscaping, including but not limited to, the removal of dead underbrush, dead weeds, or
dead grasses.

The raising of crops or animals exclusively for agricultural purposes where all excavated
material remains on-site, but not including grading for buildings or structuresthat require
a building permit unless such grading is excepted under other provisions of this section.

This section automatically applies in any of the following 3 cases:

a. The agricultural grading or clearing described above occurs on land in the Coachella
or Palo VerdeValleyslocated within Riverside County Census Tracts452.01, 452.02,
453, 454, 455, 456.01, 456.02, 457.01, 457.02, 458, 459, 460, 461 and 462,
or

b. The agricultural grading or clearing described above occurs on land that has been
farmed within the preceding 5 years; or

c. Theagricultural grading or clearing described above isconducted by an operating farm
for the purpose of farming, the land graded or cleared isused to raise crops or animals
within 1 year of the grading or clearing, and the land graded or cleared is not the
subject of a pending or approved application for residential, commercia or industria
development.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

20
In all other cases, this exception applies only if each of the following is done in the order
indicated:

(1) The person or entity seeking to grade or clear obtains an “Agricultural
Grading/Clearing Registration Form” from the office of the Agricultura
Commissioner or the Department of Building and Safety;

(2) The person or entity seeking to grade or clear completes the “ Agricultural
Grading/Clearing Registration Form” and files it with the office of the Agricultural
Commissioner;

(3) The Agricultura Commissioner reviews the *“Agricultura Grading/Clearing
Registration Form”, and based on the information contained therein and submitted
therewith recommendsto the Department of Building and Safety that the exceptions
should apply; and

(4) The Department of Building and Safety accepts the Agricultural Commissioner’s
recommendation, completesan* Agricultura Grading/Clearing Exception Form” and
transmits that form to the person or entity seeking to grade.

Within 5 working days of the receipt of the recommendation described in Subsection (3)
hereof, the Department of Building and Safety shall either accept or reect the
recommendation.

If the farming to be performed is not consistent with the farming plan described in the
above-referenced forms, a new farming plan shall be processed in accordance with
Subsections (1) through (4) hereof.

If the Agricultural Commissioner recommends that the exception should not apply; if the
Department of Building and Safety does not accept a favorable recommendation by the
Agricultural Commissioner; or if it is subsequently determined during the life of any
exception actually obtained that the planned or actual grading or clearing is not for
agricultural purposes, a grading permit shall be required. Any person aggrieved by the
decision to require a grading permit has the appeal rights set forth in Section 2.A. of this
Ordinance.

Any agricultural grading or clearing exception obtained in accordance with Subsection (1)
through (4) hereof shall ceaseto be valid if the farming plan which served as the basis for
the exception is not fully implemented within 2 years of the date that the exception is
determined applicable by the Department of Building and Safety.

Section 3308 of the Uniform Building Code is amended by changing the definition of the
word “Compaction” and by adding the following definitions, all to read:

COMPACTION: the dengfication of afill.

LANDSCAPE ARCHITECT: Anindividua registered in the State to practice in the field
of landscape architecture.

SLOPE CONTROL SPECIALIST: A professional landscape architect or other professional
person experienced in erosion control work, retained by the developer in a professional
consultive capacity and responsible for analysis, plans, specifications, supervison and
certifications regarding slope control planting and related slope control work other than
grading, for a specific project.

SLOPING LOT: A lot having a fal from front to rear, rear to front, side to side or
diagonally across the lot of five percent or more over a substantial portion of such lot.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

21
TERRACED LOT: A lot having been graded so asto create arelatively flat usable areafor
abuilding site and associated use. Such usable area shall be defined as that portion of alot
having a dope of less than five percent over amajor portion of the lot, when the remainder
of such alot isin anatural slope.
CLEARING: Theremoval of natural vegetation by any means, including but not limited to,
brushing, grubbing and discing.
FARMED: Has been subject to practices associated with the raising of crops or animals
including but not limited to plowing, seeding, cultivating, harvesting, pasturing and fallowing
for the purpose of crop rotation.
FARMING: The performance of practices associated with the raising of crops or animals
including but not limited to, plowing, seeding, cultivating, harvesting, pasturing and fallowing
for the purpose of crop rotation.
OPERATING FARM: An agricultural operation that has for at least 3 consecutive years
done each of thefollowing: owned implementsused to produce cropsor animalsor executed
agreementswith contractors who have the necessary implements; produced cropsor animals
for sale or personal use on any owned or leased land within Riverside County whether
contiguousor non-contiguous; derived incomefromthe sale of the cropsor animalsproduced
or produced such items for persona use; and generaly conformed to the Agricultural
Commissioner’s model farming plan in the production process.
RESIDENTIAL DRIVEWAY : Animprovement providing vehicular accessto no morethan
2 single family homes and any number of accessory buildings located on no more than 2
parcels.
DISCHARGER: The owner of a site where construction activity occurs.

Section 3309.1 of the Uniform Building Code is amended to read:

(@ Permits Required. Except as exempted in Sections 3304 and 3306 of this code, no
person shall do any grading without first obtaining a grading permit from the building
official. A separate permit shall be obtained for each site and may cover both
excavations and fills. After issuance of a permit authorizing rough grading work, a
permit authorizing finish grading work shall be obtained regardless of finish grading
guantities of excavation or fill.

(1) Unless exempted by the California Environmental Quality Act of 1970, no
application for a permit for grading shall be accepted unless accompanied by a
completed Environmental Assessment Form, and no grading permit shall be
issued thereon until al procedures under those rulesincluding the preparation of
afina Environmental Impact Report, if required, have been completed.

(2) No hearing shall be required for the issuance of a grading permit unless an
Environmental Impact Report isrequired to beprepared. If ahearingisrequired,
notice of thetime, place and date of the hearing shall be given in accordance with
the requirements of Section 609 of the Riverside County Rules to Implement
CEQA, at which hearing both the proposed permit and the Environmental | mpact
Report will be considered by the building official or hisauthorized representative.
Notice of thedecision shall be mailed by the building official to the applicant and
to any other person that requests notice within 15 days after closing the hearing.

(3 The decison of the building official to approve, deny or impose specid
conditionsupon agrading permit for which an Environmental I|mpact Report was
prepared and a hearing was held, may be appeaed by the applicant or any
interested party, to the Board of Supervisors. An appeal to the Board must be
filed with the Clerk of the Board of Supervisorsinwriting, on the form provided
by the Department of Building and Safety accompanied by a filing fee of $145
within 15 calendar days after the date of the mailing of the decision by the




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

22
building official.

The Board of Supervisors shall render its decision affirming, reversing or
modifying the decision of the building official within 30 days following the close
of the hearing on the appeal.

Section 3309.3 of the Uniform Building Code is amended to read:
Grading Designation.

3309.3.1. Grading in excess of 200 cubic yards, except as provided in Section 3309.3.2,
shall be performed in accordance with the approved grading plan prepared by acivil engineer
and shall be designated as* engineered grading”. Grading involving lessthan 200 cubic yards
shall be designated “regular grading” unless the permittee chooses to have the grading
performed as engineered grading, or the building official determines that specia conditions
or unusual hazards exist, in which case grading shall conform to the requirements for
engineered grading.

3309.3.2. Grading in excess of 200 cubic yards but less than 5000 cubic yards which is
associated with the construction of a single family home on one lot shall be performed in
accordance with the approved grading plan prepared by a civil engineer and shall at a
minimum comply with the following provisions:

1. Section 3309.4;

2. Section 3317.2;

3. Section 3317.3, if the grading includes filling; and

4. Section 3318.1, upon completion of the rough grading work.

However, if the permittee chooses to have the grading performed as engineered grading, or
the building official determines that special conditions or unusua hazards exist, the grading
shall conform to all the requirements for engineered grading.

Section 3309 of the Uniform Building Code is amended by adding thereto the following
subsection to read:

3309.10. Grading Plan That Includes Road Work.

1. Whenever an application for a grading permit includes grading for private roads not
offered for public dedication and such private roads are not part of a planned residential
development, the application for a grading permit shall include plans and information
related to the proposed road work, in addition to the information required for grading not
within the roadway.

2. The application for such road grading shal include plans prepared by a registered civil
engineer. The Transportation Department shall review the plans and upon completion of
the review, the Transportation Director shall make recommendations regarding the road
requirements to the building official.

3. Fees. The plan review, permit and inspection fees for that part of a grading application
relating to road grading shall be as follows:

(@) Planreview fees shall be paid to the Transportation Department in accordance with
the provisions of Riverside County Ordinance No. 671.

(b) Permit and inspection fees shall be paid to the Department of Building and Safety in




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

23
accordance with Section 4.J.7 of this ordinance.

4. Bonding may be required pursuant to Section 3311 of the Uniform Building Code.

5. Grading inspection and completion of work shall be required and conducted pursuant to
Sections 3317 and 3318 of the Uniform Building Code.

3309.11. Grading Plan that Includes a Residential Driveway

Whenever an application for a grading permit includes grading for a residential driveway,
clearance from the Fire Department prior to permit issuance may be required if:

1. Any portion of an exterior wall of thefirst story of abuilding islocated more than 150 feet
from fire apparatus access as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the
building or facility;

2. Thedriveway access exceeds 150 feet in length, or has an up or down grade of more than
15 percent; or

3. Thedriveway accessisless than 16 feet wide, or has a vertical clearance of less than 15
feet.

Appendix Chapter 33 of the Uniform Building Code is amended to read as follows:
3310.1. Genera. Feesshal be assessed in accordance with the provisions of this section.

3310.2. Plan Review Fees. When a plan or other data are required to be submitted, a plan
review fee deposit shall be paid at the time of submitting plans and specifications for review.
Said plan review fee deposit shall be based on the estimated hoursto performthe planreview.
The proceduresfor the deposit-based grading plan review fees are set forth in Section 2.F of
this Ordinance. Separate plan review fees shall apply to retaining walls or major drainage
structures as required elsewhere in this code.

3310.3. Grading Permit Fees. A fee deposit for each grading permit, based on the estimated
hours necessary to perform the required inspections, reviews and evaluations, shall be paid
to the building official. Separate permits and fees shall apply to retaining walls or major
drainage structures asrequired elsewherein thiscode. There shall be no separate charge for
standard terrace drains and similar facilities. The procedures for the deposit-based grading
permit fees are set forth in Section 2.F of this Ordinance.

Section 3312 of the Uniform Building code is amended by adding the following new
paragraph to add:

3312.3. Height of Slopes. Cut slopes shall not be constructed over 30 feet in height unless
the building official is furnished evidence by a written report from a soil engineer that such
dope will be stable with a Factor of at least one and one-half (1.5).

Section 3313 of the Uniform Building Code is amended by adding the following new
paragraph to read:

3313.6. Height of Slopes. Fill dopes shall not be constructed over 30 feet in height unless
the building official is furnished evidence by a written report from a soil engineer that such
dope will be stable with a Factor of at least one and one-half (1.5).

3313.7. Stockpiling. A stockpile is a supply of earth material placed on a site, for a




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

10.

11.

24
temporary period of time not to exceed 12 months. It shall be authorized in conjunction with
an approved construction project and shall not obstruct or divert natural drainage or water
courses. It shall be carefully maintained and under no circumstances cause an adverse effect
to adjacent properties. Erosion and dust control measures shall be implemented pursuant to
Section 4.J.13 of thisordinance, and fencing may be required as determined by the building
official. The borrow site shall be permitted pursuant to the provisions of this ordinance and
the quantity of excavated earth material may not exceed the authorized quantity for either site.
A stockpile shall not be authorized until such time as a stockpiling registration is submitted
to and approved by the building official. A stockpiling registration shall expire 12 months
from the date of issuance. Upon expiration, the stockpile shall be removed pursuant to a
grading permit authorizing such removal unless a new stockpiling registration is submitted
to and approved by the building official. A stockpiling registration may be approved by the
building official up to an additional 3 times for the same site. The registration fee for
stockpiles will be computed pursuant to the Grading deposit-based fee system set forth in
Section 2.F of this Ordinance. The initial deposit charged will be 10 hours (tota for plan
review and inspections) at the Fully Burdened Hourly Rate.

Section 3314 of the Uniform Building Code is amended by adding the following new
paragraph to read:

3314.5. Structure Setback from Slope. Setbacks between graded slopes (cut or fill) and
structures or masonry walls shall bein accordance with Figure No. 18-1-1; except that opes
steeper than two horizontal: one vertical height shall be set back a distance, based upon the
dope failure circle, determined by a slope stability analysis prepared by a registered civil
engineer, which shall provide adequate protection for the structure in case of dope failure.
Natural slopes steeper than four horizontal to one vertical shall observe the same setbacks as
graded dopes.

Section 3315 of the Uniform Building Code is amended by adding thereto a new subsection
to read:

3315.6 Parking Lots.
(1) Minimum parking lot grade for asphalt concrete shall be 1%.
(2) Minimum grade for concrete ribbon drains shall be 0.35%.

(3) Anapproved soil sterilizer shall be used on all subgrade surfaces prior to placement of
paving.

(4) Two specia inspections are required by the Department of Building and Safety; one
inspection at the time the base is placed, and the second when the asphalt concrete or
concrete has been placed, unless an engineer’ s report verifies compliance with design.

(5) The contractor shall be responsible for the clearing of the proposed work area, and
relocation and costs of all existing utilities. The County shall be informed 48 hours
prior to beginning of construction.

(6) A compaction report by a Soils Engineer shall certify 95% compaction of base for
asphalt concrete and 90% compaction of base for concrete prior to calling for second
ingpection and placement of asphalt concrete and concrete paving.

(7) 1f no preliminary soils report is provided specifying the paving section, the structural
section shall be three inches asphalt concrete and four inches Class |1 aggregate bases.




25
Section 3316.1 of the Uniform Building Code is amended to read:

PERMANENT EROSION CONTROL - LANDSCAPING

3316.1. Slopes. Thefacesof cut and fill Slopes shall be prepared and maintained to control
erosion and to provide stability. Where cut slopes are not subject to erosion due to erosion-
resistant character of materials, such protection may be omitted. Unless otherwise
recommended in the approved soil engineering or engineering geology report, cut and fill
dopes shall be planted in accordance with this section. This protection for the slopes shall
be installed as soon as practicable and prior to calling for final permit approval.

1. General Requirements - All lopes equal to or greater than 3' in vertical height shall be

© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

planted with drought-tolerant grass or ground cover in order to protect the slope from
erosionand instability. Other slopes as deemed necessary by the building official shall also
be planted.

Slopes exceeding 15 feet in vertical height shall be planted with drought-tolerant shrubs,
spaced at no more than 10 feet on center; or trees, spaced not to exceed 20 feet on center,
or acombination of such shrubs and trees at equivalent spacings, in addition to adrought-
tolerant grass or ground cover. Fifty percent of the total number of trees provided shall
be of adrought-tolerant nature and a minimum of 5-gallon size. The plants selected and
planting methods used shall be suitable for the soil and climatic conditions found on the
gte. The landscape design shall consider and locate plants in zones, according to their
water needs. Plant materials and planting patterns may be varied upon the
recommendations of alandscape architect or aslope control specialist with approval of the
building official.

If a species other than those from the recommended plantsindicated on Riverside County
Building and Safety Form 284-41 is selected, awritten statement shall be submitted by a
landscape architect or dope control specialist certifying that the plant is drought-tolerant
and suitable for erosion control and sope stabilization purposes. This statement must
accompany the grading plan at the time of submittal. Plant material shall be allowed that
isspecifically identified asbeing drought-tolerant and suitablefor erosion control and slope
stabilization on an erosion control landscape plan signed by a registered landscape
architect.

. Erosion-Control Landscape and Irrigation Plan Requirements.

(@) Erosion-Control Landscape Plan Requirements. Landscape plans shall be submitted
for al dopesrequired to be planted. The landscape plan may be incorporated as part
of the grading plan unless, in the opinion of the building official, the plan becomestoo
obscured to be effective. A landscape plan shall include:

(1) A dope planting schedule that provides common and scientific names and
specifications of al plants, including the names of all species, number and size of
each tree and shrub and the spacing of plants.

(2) Thelocation of the planting.

(3) Erosion-Control landscape plans involving more than four structures shall be
prepared and signed by aregistered landscape architect. This plan shall include
the details necessary to complete the project including scope of work, materials
to beused (seed mixtures, plant specieslisted by size, quantity, fertilizer used and
rateof application), construction methods, maintenance, and timetablefor project
completion.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

26
(b) Irrigation Plan Requirements. Except where approved by the building official, Sopes
required to be planted shall be provided with an approved system of irrigation
designed to cover al portions of the dope and shall be of sufficient clarity to indicate
the extent of work proposed. Theirrigation system shall have zones which take into
account the water requirements of the different types of plant species located in the
zone and shall be adjusted to vary the water within the zone in accordance with the
needs of the plant material. Care shall be taken to minimize runoff. Turf areas shall
be irrigated separately from slope areas. The irrigation system provided shall make
use of automatic timers, moisture sensors and low precipitation heads or emitters.
Theuseof adrip typeirrigation systemishighly recommendationswherever possible.
Seasonal irrigation requirementsof the plant speciesproposed shall be determined and
recommendations provided as to the duration and frequency of irrigation.
Specificationsfor proposed devices, size and type of pipe, flow and precipitationrates
are to be includes on the erosion-control landscape plan.

An approved backflow prevention device shall be installed in each irrigation system
which conforms to Chapter 6 of the Uniform Plumbing Code. Projects with access
to or of sufficient size to economically justify the use of reclaimed water through use
of a dual distribution system are encouraged to do so. Prior to building official
approval, reclaimed water irrigation systems are subject to the approval of the State
Water Quality Control Board.

If the planting requirements specified in Section 4 are waived by the building official,
the requirements specified in this subsection may be waived.

Planting Method. Planting shall commence as soon as slopes are completed on any
portion of the site and shall provide for rapid short term coverage of the slope as well
as long term permanent coverage. Minimum requirements shall include:

(@) Planting Holes. Planting holes shall be excavated twice as wide asthe diameter
and 2 inches less than the depth of the root ball of the plant. The planting holes
shall be backfilled with a mixture of native soil, lowly decomposing organic
matter and an appropriate fertilizer. The construction of awatering basin at the
base of al trees and shrubs at a distance encompassing the drip line is
recommended in order to encourage deep percolation of irrigation. The
application of mulch to the surface area of the watering basin will help minimize
the amount of irrigation lost to evaporation. A commercially prepared mulch,
wood chips, grass clippings or a combination of vegetal matter may be used in
thisregard.

(b) Staking. Each tree shall be staked in order to anchor the root system and to
support the trunk in an upright position. Stake material shall be of adequate
dimension and length to support thetree. Tiesused for tying thetreeto the stake
shall have a broad surface to minimize rubbing or girding and have some
elagticity. Inlieu of stakes, athree-wire tie-down system may be used.

(c) Ground Cover Spacing. Ground covers are to be spaced in such a manner that
100% coverage of the planted dope will be achieved in as short a time as
possible.

(d) Thefinish grading and drainage provided on the adjacent all planted slopes, shall
promote health plant growth and minimize erosion and runoff.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

27
Waiver of Planting Requirements. Waiver of planting and irrigation requirements may
be approved by the building official if found to be unreasonable or unnecessary for one
of the following reasons:

(@ Theerosionresistant character of material composing the slopes makes planting
unnecessary.

(b)  The unavailability of water making irrigation either impossible or impractical.
(c) Slope heights are less than those requiring planting by Section 4.J.12(a)1.

Compliance with Section 4.J.13 is required regardless of any waiver of planting
requirements.

Planting Maintenance. All vegetation planted for erosion control shall be maintained
inahealthy, vigorouscondition. Maintenance of slopesshall includewatering, weeding
and restoration of any plant material that may die. Slopesthat are affected by thefuture
installation of walls, fences, swimming poolsor any other building must be properly re-
planted upon the completion of subsequent projects.

Bonding. A performance bond for all projectsinvolving more than four structures and
such other projects, as may be determined by the building official, shall be required for
erosion control remedies, at the time the landscaping planis approved. The bond shall
be released upon approval of the final planting inspection but may be earlier released
in the discretion of the building official. Compliance with Section 4.J.13. is required
regardless of any bond release.

Final Planting Inspection. A final planting inspection shall be required for al building
sites requiring planting. For building sites not requiring a performance bond, the fina
planting inspection shall be approved prior to the building permit final inspection. Any
required irrigation system and all planting shall be installed at the time of the final
planting inspection. A functional test of the irrigation system may be required. For
building sites requiring a performance bond, slope certification required by the next
subsection shall be approved prior to the building permit final inspection. The final
planting inspection shall be performed at the end of the one-year bond period.

Slope Veification. A siteinspection shall be performed by the responsible landscape
architect to assure compliance with the approved plansand to perform afunctional test
of the sprinkler system. Said landscape architect shall verify in writing to the building
officia that the soils additives, amendments, weed control, planting of the dopes and
the installation of the irrigation system comply to the approved plans and to al the
provisions of thissection. Verificationto contain astatement asto grow stock vitality.

Landscape and Irrigation Plan/Plan-Checking and Bond Processing Fee. Before
accepting aset of plansand specificationsfor checking, the Department of Building and
Safety shall collect aplan checking fee deposit. The amount of the fee deposit for plan
checking and any required permit for landscaping and irrigation shall be: based on the
number of hours required to review plans, process required bonds, and perform
inspections. The initial deposit, in addition to the corresponding project fees as set
forth in Table 3-G of this Ordinance, shall be as follows:

Initial Fee Deposit
-4 10tS .o 0.75 hours per lot
5ormorelots . ... . 3 hours plus 0.2 hours per lot




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

13.

28
Section 3316 of the Uniform Building Code is amended by adding a new subsection to
read:

3316.3 All construction sites subject to regulations under this ordinance shall comply with
the requirements of this section. During Site construction, construction activities shall be
designed and conducted to minimize runoff of sediment and all other pollutants onto
public properties, other private properties and into waters of the United States as required
by this Section and Riverside County Ordinance No. 754. Erosion and sediment control
measures utilized by the permittee shall not conflict with the requirements of Riverside
County Ordinance Nos. 546 and 695. All dischargers who are required to file a Notice of
Intent (NOI), under the provisions of the National Pollutant Discharge Elimination System
(NPDES) General Permit No. CAS000002, State Water Resources Control Board Order
Number 92-08-DWQ, shall develop and implement a Storm Water Pollutant Prevention
Plan (SWPPP), a monitoring program, and a reporting plan as required by the Federal
Water Pollution Control Act (Clean Water Act) and implementing regulations
promulgated by the U.S. Environmental Protection Agency.

A.  Construction Activities Involving Disturbances of Less Than 5 Acres.

Construction activities including clearing, grading or excavation of land which
disturbs less than 5 acres and requires a grading permit shall provide for effective
control of erosion, sediment and all other pollutants from October 15 through April
15. The permittee shall be responsible for the installation and monitoring of
effective erosion and sediment controls. Such controls may be evaluated by the
Department of Building and Safety as described in Subsection B.4.

B. Construction Activities Involving Disturbances of 5 Acres or More.

Construction activities including but not limited to clearing, grading or excavation of
land, which disturbs 5 acres or more or on-sites which are part of alarger common
plan of development which disturbs 5 acres or more, require compliance with the
following provisions:

1. Notice of Intent. Dischargers must file a Notice of Intent (NOI) along with the
current filing fee established by the State Water Resources Control Board
(SWRCB), for the development of each construction site, to the SWRCB. A
copy of the NOI and the discharger’ s identification number, which is issued by
SWRCB, shall be submitted to the Department of Building and Safety prior to
the issuance of a grading permit.

2. Storm Water Pollution Prevention Plan. A Storm Water Pollution Prevention
Plan (SWPPP) shall be developed and implemented for each construction site.

a. The name, address and phone number (including a 24-hour emergency phone
number) of the person responsible for implementing, inspecting and reporting
of the site SWPPP, shall be provided in writing to the Department of Building
and Safety Grading Division, prior to the issuance of a grading permit. The
person responsible for the SWPPP shall continue to be available until
completion of the project. Any change of such person responsible for the
SWPPP shall be filed with the Department of Building and Safety within 24
hours, by the discharger filing the NOI.

b. Upon commencement of and during construction activities, a current copy of
the SWPPP shall be kept on the construction site and made available to the
Department of Building and Safety upon request.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

29
Between October 15 and April 15, Best Management Practices (BMPs) shall
be maintained and be in place for all areas that have been graded or disturbed
and for all material, equipment and/or operations that need protection.
Remova BMPs (those BMPs which must be temporarily removed during
construction activities) shall be in place at the end of each working day when
there is aforecast of rain within the next five days, by the National Weather
Service or whenever rain is imminent.

Between April 16 and October 14, BMPs shall be maintained and in place for
all areasthat have been graded or disturbed and for all material, equipment
and/or operations that need protection within 24 hours of aforecast of rain
within the next 5 days by the National Weather Service or whenever rain is
imminent.

Ownership Notification. 1f ownership of the construction site changes at any
time prior to completion of construction, the new owner of the site shall
provide the information required in Subsection 3316.3.B.1 and 2.a. above.
The party transferring ownership of the construction site shall inform the new
owner of thisrequirement. Notification pursuant to this subsection by the
new owner shall not be required if permanent erosion and sediment control
protection measures have been implemented on the construction site pursuant
to Subsection 3316.3.B.i.I1 below.

Construction Process. During the construction process the person identified
as responsible for the SWPPP pursuant to Subsection 3316.3.B.2.a shall be
required to:

a. Bepresent on site to ensure BMPs are functioning properly.

b. Conduct regular inspections to ascertain if BMPs should be modified to
adjust to current site conditions.

c. Update the site copy of the SWPPP which identifies BMP changes required
for current site conditions. Revisions may be highlighted on the site copy
of the SWPPP. All changes shall be noted at the latest, on the first
working day subsequent to any actual field changes being made. For
record purposes, the SWPPP title block shall reflect the date of any
change.

d. Conduct inspections of the construction site prior to an anticipated storm
event to ensure that BMPs are adequate.

e. Conduct inspections subsequent to storm events to ensure that BMPs are
performed adequately. During multiple days of rain or rain of high
intensity, conduct additional inspections as necessary to establish that all
BMPs are performing adequately.

f. Ensure that equipment, material and workers are available for rapid
response to emergencies.

g. Perform necessary maintenance to BMPs within 48 hours of the conclusion
of each storm.

h. Keep arecord of all inspections performed on the site. This record shall be
made available to the Department of Building and Safety upon request.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

30
i. If aconstruction site becomes idle (a site which is inactive for a period of
more than 30 days), compliance with the following shall be required:

[ All BMPs identified in the SWPPP shall continue to be maintained,
and the person responsible for the SWPPP shall remain in charge of
the site, or

1.  The SWPPP shal be revised to provide for permanent erosion
protection. If anon-irrigated vegetation by seeding is proposed as
primary erosion protection for the site, such seeding will not be
considered acceptable until each germination and adequate growth
has taken place on al critical aress.

[11.  The Department of Building and Safety shall be notified in writing by
the discharger who filed the NOI that the construction site is or will
become idle. The person responsible for the SWPPP shall inspect the
construction site to verify that the site is adequately protected. An
inspection by the Department of Building and Safety shall also be
requested. Additional protection measures may be required by the
building official. Any construction site found idle for more than 30
days without the installation of appropriate protection measures and
notification that the construction project isidle, shall be considered in
violation of this section.

4. Monitoring Criteria. Monitoring for erosion and sediment control is required as
detailed in this section. Site monitoring shall be performed by the person
responsible for the SWPPP. The Department of Building and Safety may also
monitor site compliance at any time and require access to the updated site SWPPP
and records of all inspections made. The site monitoring will be conducted as
determined by the building official. Fees will be paid pursuant to Table No. 3-H of
this ordinance. The construction site may be considered in compliance with this
section if the BMPs are deemed effective. The BMPs shall be deemed effective if:

a

Construction site sediment is not present outside the permit site or is not present
on the site in an area which requires protection.

Structural controls are not breached or have not failed under storm events of
minor intensity defined as precipitation of two-year frequency and 24-hour
duration.

Evidence of erosion is not present on manufactured and/or denuded natural
dopes.

No evidence of construction site sediment buildup in downstream storm drains
and/or drainage ways is apparent.

Controls are maintained in accordance with design guidelines.

The SWPPP is updated in accordance with the actual construction sequence, and
BMPs are installed according to actual construction progress.

The SWPPP includes sufficient BMPs to ensure that erosion and sediment and all
other pollutants will be realistically controlled (to propose no BMPs is not
acceptable).




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

31
The Department of Building and Safety may require the owner of the construction
site to engage aregistered civil engineer or other qualified professional within 24
hours, to supervise the implementing, inspecting and reporting of the site SWPPP as
indicated in Subsections 2, 3, and 4 of Section 4J.13.B. Such professional shall
review the site SWPPP, make any necessary changes and/or additions, and report in
writing to the Department of Building and Safety to confirm that adequate BMPs
have been installed; and continue to supervise the site SWPPP until the Department
of Building and Safety agrees such supervision is no longer required. A demand
may be sought against any project grading and erosion control landscape securities
to rectify any deficiencies in the SWPPP and the BMPs identified in the SWPPP.

. When all site construction is completed, the discharger who filed the NOI shall

provide the Department of Building and Safety with a copy of the Notice of
Termination furnished to the State Water Resources Control Board. The grading
permit log number(s) for the construction site shall be submitted with said Notice of
Termination.

Section 3318.1.2 of the Uniform Building Code is amended to include:

The format of the Soils Grading report shall comply with the guidelines set forth in
Riverside County Technical Guidelines for Review of Geotechnical and Geologic Reports.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

32
SECTION 5
MECHANICAL CODE
SECTION 5.

The Uniform Mechanical Code, 1994 edition, including the Appendix thereof and including the Standards
therein, as adopted by the International Conference of Building Officials, is hereby adopted as a part of the
Building Code of the County of Riverside and made a part of this Ordinance by reference (three copies of
which are on filefor use and examination by the public in the office of the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors)
with the following modifications:

A.  Section 104, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116, and 117 are deleted.

B. A fee for each permit shall be paid to the building official as set forth in Table 3-C of this
Ordinance.

SECTION 6
PLUMBING CODE AND SWIMMING POOL CODE
SECTION 6.

The Uniform Plumbing Code, 1994 edition, including the appendices and theinstallation standards contained
therein and the Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code, 1994 edition, as adopted by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, is hereby adopted as the Plumbing Code of
the County of Riverside and made a part of this Ordinance by reference (three copies of which are on file
for use and examination by the public in the office of the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors) except those
parts thereof, titled Administration (Sections 101.5 through 103.8 of the Uniform Plumbing Code; and
Sections 1.0 through 1.18 of the Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code) which are deleted.

SECTION 7
ELECTRICAL CODE
SECTION 7.

The National Electrical Code, 1993 edition, as published by the National Fire Protection Association, is
hereby adopted as the Electrical Code of the County of Riverside and made a part of this Ordinance by
reference (three copies of which are on file for use and examination by the public in the office of the Clerk
of the Board of Supervisors), with the following additions:

A. Ingalation Standards. All electrica installations in the unincorporated area of the County of
Riverside shall bein accordancewiththisOrdinance, the National Electrical Code, except ashereafter
modified, and all applicable statutes of the State of California.

B. Theconductorsand equipment required or permitted by this Ordinance shall be acceptable only when
approved. The building official may classify as “approved” electrica materials, devices, fittingsand
appliances used in electrical installations that have been listed or labeled after examination for safety
as described in the National Electrical Code, Article 90-6. Aluminum wire shall be AA-8000 series
only.

C. Used Materials. Previously used electrical materials shall not be reused without written approval
obtained in advance from the building official.

D. The following modifications are made to the National Electrical Code:




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

33
1. Section 210-8(a)(2) is amended to read:

Exception No. 2(a)(2): Receptaclesfor appliances occupying dedicated space which are cord-
and plug-connected in accordance with Section 400-7(a)(6), (&)(7), or (a)(8), and of the single,
round “T” dot type, and shall be rated not less than the branch circuit.

2. Liquidtight Flexible Conduit shall be the only approved flexible conduit used for wiring exposed
to weather or temperature differentials. Installation shall be as required in Article 351 of the
National Electrical Code.

E. Overhead Electrical Conductors. Electrical conductors under the control and maintenance of an
electrical public utility company shall be limited in proximity to new or existing swimming pools, by
Cdlifornia Public Utilities Commission General Orders 95, Overhead Line Construction, Rules 54.4
a4, 54.8 85, and Resolution No. E 1109, Appendix B and C, effective January 2, 1962.

F. Electrified Fences. Electrified fences for animal control shall be identified by a permanent sign
attached to the fence every 50 feet and on each gate. In addition, the electric charging equipment
shall have a marking to indicate product examination by a testing laboratory such as Underwriters
Laboratories, Inc.

G. Mobile Homes Not in Mobile Home Parks. Electric service supplying mobile homes used for
residential purposes in other than approved mobile home parks shall have the following minimum
servicerequirements: Service conductorsand equipment shall berated at not lessthan 100 amperes;
branch circuit provision for six overcurrent devices.

H. Electrica Fees. A feefor each permit shall be paid to the building official as set forthin Table 3-B
of this Ordinance. Failure to obtain a permit prior to commencing any electrical work for which a
permit is required shall require a payment of a double fee, except that for emergency repair work, a
permit shall be obtained within 72 hours after commencement of the emergency work.

SECTION 8
SIGN CODE
SECTION 8.

The Uniform Sign Code, 1994 edition, as adopted by the International Conference of Building Officials, is
hereby adopted and made a part of this Ordinance by reference (three copies of which are on file for use by
the public in the office of the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors). Feesare listed under Section 2 (Uniform
Administrative Code) and Section 7 (Electrical Code).

SECTION 9
CODE FOR BUILDING CONSERVATION
SECTION 9.

The Uniform Code for Building Conservation, 1994 edition, as adopted by the International Conference of
Building Officials, is hereby adopted and made a part of the Ordinance by reference (three copies of which
are on file for use by the public in the office of the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors).




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

SECTION 10
RELOCATIONS
SECTION 10.
A. No personshall relocate on, or move onto any premises, or permit to berelocated on, or moved onto

any premises, in the unincorporated area of the County of Riverside, any building or structure that
is subject to the provisions of this Ordinance, without first obtaining a relocation permit from the
building official.

The building officia shall issue relocation permits only for buildings and structures that conform to
al of the standards of this Ordinance or which, through minimal amounts of reconstruction as
determined by the building official, can be made to conformto al of the standards of this Ordinance
and other applicable codes and standards.

Any person desiring to relocate a building or structure shall first make an application for each such
building or structurein accordancewith 302.1 (1, 2, 3, 6 and 7), of the Uniform Administrative Code
to obtain a special inspection permit. Also, as a part of this application, the applicant shall furnish
photographs and a floor plan of the building or structure proposed to be moved, with a detalled
written description of any proposed repair, ateration or addition to the building or structure along
with a plot plan of the new site showing the building or structure situated relative to property lines.
This application shall be accompanied by a fee as set forth in Section 2.F of this Ordinance.
Dwellings with garages, attached or detached, shall be considered as one building.

Upon receipt of all required information from the applicant the building official shall inspect the
building or structure proposed to be moved and the proposed relocation site. Upon completion of
his inspection, the building official shall prepare a written report which shall be mailed to the
applicant. The report shal contain the approva or disapproval of the building official, and if
approved for relocation, shall specify all work that must be performed to make the building or
structure conform to this Ordinance and any other necessary requirements. Thisreport shall bevalid
only for a period of 45 days after the date of issuance by the building official and only for the
approved building or structure and approved relocation site. The contents of this report and all
proposed work shall be incorporated into plans and specifications in accordance with Section 302.2
and 302.3 of the Uniform Administrative Code and accompany an application for a permit in
accordance with Section 302.1 of the Uniform Administrative Code within 45 days time frame.

After the building official has approved abuilding or structure for relocation, the relocation site, and
all plans and specifications the applicant may, prior to the expiration of the plan check permit, apply
for amoving permit and the necessary building permitsto performthe work. The feefor the moving
permit shall be $30.00, and the fee for required building permits shal be determined from the
applicable provisions of this Ordinance. Asapart of the application, the applicant shall certify that
no changes have been made to the building or structure since the date of inspection by the building
official.

No relocation permit shall be issued unlessthe applicant first furnishes awritten report of aqualified
termite inspector that it isfree from termites or other vermin and shall post with the building official
a cash deposit, the amount of which shall be based on the square footage of the structure to be
relocated, as follows:

1. 750s0.ft. 101000 S ft. .. oo $3,000.00
2. Everyadditiona 500 Sq. ft. . ... . . $500.00

In determining the amount of square footage, dwellings with attached or detached garages will be
considered onestructure; al other structuresshall be considered separately and shall require adeposit
for each structure. In lieu of cash, the applicant may substitute a bank cashier’s check, an bank or
savings and loan money order, or a bank certificate of deposit. All of the above must be made




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

35
payableto the County of Riverside, Department of Building and Safety. Inall casesno substitute for
a cash deposit will be acceptable if it may be recalled by the applicant without the consent of the
County of Riversor if it requires any act other than the cashing thereof for collection by the County
of Riverside. The return of the cash deposit or other security shall be conditioned upon the
performance of all termsand conditions of a permit withinthe prescribed time limitson any extension
thereof.

If the permittee does not complete all the required construction, repairs, and changeswithin 150 days
of issuance of the relocation permit or any granted extension thereof, the building official shall give
written notice thereof by certified mail to the permittee specifying the work that has not been
completed and the date the relocation permit or extension of said permit isdueto expire. Thisnotice
shall also state that the deposit shall be forfeited if substantial work is not completed on the building
and that a written request for inspection thereof must be filed with the building official or that a
request for extension befiled in accordance with Section 303.4 of the Uniform Administrative Code
prior to the expiration date of said relocation permit. If the permittee failsto comply with the notice
of the building official, the permit shall expire and the deposit shall be forfeited.

1. Upon receipt of the forfeited deposit, the building official, at his option, may cause the removal
or demolition of said building or structure. Inthe event that the cost of removing or demolishing
the building or structure is less than the required deposit, the excess thereof shall be deposited
withthe County Treasurer to the credit of the owner of the property of such other person legally
entitled thereto, which shall be payable upon proof satisfactory to the Treasurer.

Temporary Building or Structure Relocation. No building or structure shall be moved to any
temporary relocation site within the County of Riverside, except to be an approved relocation yard
located on property zoned for such use.

The building official shall have access to all premises described in a relocation permit whether
permanent or temporary in order to inspect the building or structure involved, the progress of the
work, and to perform any of the acts authorized or required by this Ordinance.

No officer of thisCounty who isauthorized to issue apermit to transport abuilding or structure upon
a County highway shall issue such a permit until arelocation permit has been issued by the building
official for the building or structure, or until the owner or person in control of the building or
structure has filed with the building official an affidavit that the building or structure is not to be
located temporarily or permanently, in the unincorporated area of the County of Riverside, except
inan approved relocation yard located on property zoned for such use. No building or structure shall
be transported upon any County highway unlessthe owner or person in control thereof has obtained
a permit from the Director of Transportation.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

36
SECTION 11
PREFABRICATED BUILDINGS

SECTION 11.

Prefabricated buildings, which areto belocated in Riverside County are subject to all of the provisionsof this
Ordinance regulating the construction of new buildings, unless such factory-built housing is manufactured
in accordance with the requirements contained in the Health and Safety Code (Section 19960 et seq.) and
Chapter 2 of Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations.

A. A prefabricated building is designed as a building which is assembled, or partly assembled, at aplace
other than the site on which it is to be permanently located.

B. A special permit shall be obtained for prefabricated buildings, in addition to regular building permits,
if the building is prefabricated outside of the limits of the County of Riverside. The permittee shall
pay afee of 62 cents per milefor each miletraveled to the prefabrication site for inspection purposes,
from the nearest point on the boundary of the County of Riverside measured by way of the shortest
route usually traveled.

C. Factory Built Housing.

1.

Definition. “Factory-built housing” means aresidential building, dwelling unit or an individual
dwelling room or combination of roomsthereof, including units designed or used asapart of an
institution for resident or patient care, which is either wholly manufactured or is in substantial
part manufactured at an off-site location to be wholly or partially manufactured on-site in
accordance with regulations adopted by the Commission of Housing and Community
Development of the State of California pursuant to Section 19990 of the California Health and
Safety Code.

Requirements. Factory-built housing installed in the County of Riverside shall conformto all
the requirements of other housing installed in said County except as such housing may be
exempted from such requirements by the provisionsof the CaliforniaFactory-Built Housing Law
(Sections 19960 to 19997 inclusive of the Health and Safety Code) and regulations adopted
pursuant thereto (Sections 3003 to 3150, Title 25, California Code of Regulations).

Inspectionsand Feefor Permit. The County of Riverside shall make inspections of factory-built
housing required of other housing in the County except such as are made by the Department of
Housing and Community Development pursuant to the California Factory-Built Housing Law
and regulations adopted pursuant thereto. The permit fee covering the costs of the inspections
required to be made to the installation of factory-built housing in the County of Riverside shall
be $75.00, and no other fee shall be charged by the County. Division of Housing approved
components system will be treated as a conventional house with full charge for plan check and
permit fee.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

37

SECTION 12
MANUFACTURED HOMES,
MOBILE HOMES OR COMMERCIAL COACHES

SECTION 12.

A.

Installation of Manufactured Homes, Mobile Home or Commercial Coach. No person shal install
or occupy any manufactured home, mobile home or commercial coach (hereafter called * Unit”) to
be used for the purpose of human habitation or occupancy on any site inside or outside of a mobile
home park in the unincorporated area of the County of Riverside, without first obtaining a permit
from the building official. Each unit shall bear an insignia of approval issued by the California
Department of Housing or a label issued pursuant to the Federal Mobile Home Construction and
Safety Standards.

1. Applications shall be made to the building official in the forms provided by the Department of
Building and safety only in the district office having jurisdiction. The applicant shall furnish all
the information required by Section 18200 et seq. of the California Health and Safety Code and
Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations, and shall be accompanied by the required fees.

2. Theinstalationof all unitsshall bein accordancewiththerelevant requirements of the California
Health and Safety Code and Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations relating to such
installations and in accordance with any specific requirements of this Ordinance.

Manufactured Home on aFoundation System. Notwithstanding theforegoing, no person shall install
any manufactured home, certified under the National Manufactured Housing Construction and Safety
Act of 1974 (42 U.S.C. Sec. 5401 et seg.), on afoundation system, pursuant to Section 18551 of the
Health and Safety Code on alot zoned for aconventional single-family residential dwelling unlessthe
following requirements are satisfied:

1. Roofing Material. Any roofing material permitted under this Ordinance, except metal roofing,
may be utilized.

2. Siding Material. Any siding material permitted under this Ordinance, except metal siding, may
be utilized.

3. All manufactured homes shall be no less than 750 square feet.

4. Therequirements of this section shall not apply if the manufactured homeis already in place on
the lot for which the permit is sought and was approved pursuant to a permit previoudly issued
by the County of Riverside.

Commercial Coaches. Each unit shall bear an insignia of approval issued by the California
Department of Housing or alabel issued pursuant to the Federal Mobile Home and Safety Standards.
The insignia shall designate the applicable occupancy classification and the design roof, floor, and
wind loads.

1. The applicant for a permit to install a commercial coach shall provide two sets of plans and
specifications. The plans shall include the following:

a) A plot plan of the lot or site on which the commercial coach is to be installed, which shall
indicate the planned location of the commercial coach, and the locations of electrical, gas,
water and sewer connections on the site. The plot plan shall indicate all dimensions and
setbacks from the lot lines.

b) The number of the insignia of approval and the serial number of the commercia coach.




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

38
¢) The approved manufacturer’s installation instructions specifying the following:

1) Thelocation and required capacity of stabilizing devices (tiedowns, piers, blocking, etc.)
on which the design is based.

2) Devices and methodsto be used in connecting al components and systems, including but
not limited to roofs, walls, floors and utilities.

d) Load bearing supportsand support structuresshall bedesigned and constructedinaccordance
with design requirements of the Uniform Building Code.

Plan review and site preparation and installation permit fees shal be the same as set forth in
Section 1020 and 1024 of Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations.

D. Abatement of substandard mobile homes, manufactured homes, commercial coaches, recreational
vehicles or mobile home accessory buildings and structures within or outside of a mobile home or
specia occupancy park and substandard buildings or structures within a mobile home or specid
occupancy park shall be in accordance with this Section.

1.

Public Nuisance. Every substandard mobile home, manufactured home, commercial coach,
recreational vehicle or mobile home accessory building or structure within or outside of amobile
home or special occupancy park and every substandard building or structure within a mobile
home or special occupancy park as defined in Section 1640, 1704, 1706, 1738 of Title 25,
Cdlifornia Code of Regulations, is hereby declared to be a nuisance as defined in Chapter 4 of
the Uniform Housing Code, and shall be abated by repair, rehabilitation, demolition or removal
as hereinafter provided.

Substandard mobile homes, manufactured homes, commercia coachesand recreational vehicles
shall be abated in accordance with the provisions of Sections 1708 - 1726 of Title 25, California
Code of Regulations.

Substandard mobile home accessory buildings or structures within or outside of a mobile home
or specia occupancy park and substandard buildings or structures within a mobile home or
special occupancy park shall be abated in accordance with the procedures set forth in Section 3
of this Ordinance.

Substandard mobile homes, manufactured homes or commercial coaches on permanent
foundation systems shall be abated in accordance with the procedures set forth in Section 3 of
this Ordinance.

Summary Abatement. Where the building official or his designee determines that a public
nuisance constitutes an immediate threat to public health and safety, summary abatement shall
be authorized as per Section 3.B.2. of this Ordinance.

E. Other Fees*

pwWbhE

LOW Profile. . ..o $52.50
Permanent FOUuNdation ... ...t $52.50
Permanent FoundationwithPlanReview . . . ... ... i $138.19
Permanent Foundation, County Document RecordingFee . . .............. $9.00 per unit

*Does Not Include Permit Processing Fee




© 00 N o o s~ w N Pk

N T N T N N N S N S N N S T e e S T S
0o N o o M WwWDN BRPBP O O 0o N o o W DN - O

39
SECTION 13
ENFORCEMENT, LEGAL PROCEDURES, AND PENALTIES
SECTION 13.

The Sheriff, District Attorney, County Counsel, Director of Transportation, Building Official, Director of
Environmental Health Services, Clerk of the Board of Supervisors, Planning Director, and all County
Officials charged with the issuance of licenses and permits shall enforce the provisions of this Ordinance.

A. NoPermitsTo Belssued. No permit of any nature shall be issued pursuant to the provisions of this
Ordinance unless it is in accordance with all the provisions of this Ordinance. Any permit issued
contrary to the provisions of this Ordinance shall be void and of no effect.

B. The procedures, remedies and penalties for violation of this Ordinance and for recovery of costs
related to enforcement are provided for in Ordinance No. 725, which is incorporated herein by
reference.

SECTION 14
VALIDITY OF ORDINANCE
SECTION 14.

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this Ordinance is for any reason, held to be
unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The
Board of Supervisors hereby declares it would have passed this Ordinance, and each section, subsection,
sentence, clause and phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections,
sentences, clauses or phrases might be declared unconstitutional. Appendix 1, attached hereto, is added to
this ordinance and incorporated by reference therein.

SECTION 15

The provisions of this Ordinance shall take effect 30 days after its adoption. The Board declares that this
Ordinance shall be construed as a continuation of existing Ordinance No. 457 and not as a new enactment,
except asto any provisionsof this Ordinance which areinconsistent therewith. Any permit previously issued
under Ordinance No. 457 and complying therewith shall be deemed to comply with this Ordinance. The
Board further declares that any modifications herein to the portions of the uniform codes required to be
adopted pursuant to the State Law are essentially modifications previously adopted by thisBoard, which are
being reenacted as a part of the over al revision of the Ordinance.

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF
RIVERSIDE, STATE OF CALIFORNIA

By __ Robert A. Buster
Chairman

ADOPTED: February 16, 1999

GERALD A. MALONEY
Clerk of the Board

By__ Margie Lozano

Deputy
(SEAL)




